
STANDING COMMITTEES—ESTABLISHMENT—AMENDMENT 

Resolution of Appointment 

 

At its meeting on Thursday 4 December 2025, the Assembly resolved to amend as follows: 

 

That: 

The resolution of the Assembly of 3 December 2024, as amended on 4 February 2025 and 26 June 
2025, that established general purpose standing committees, be amended as follows:  

(1) in the last column of the third row of the table (which describes the Economics, Industry and 
Recreation committee), omit “6 Member committee” and substitute “5 Member committee”;  

(2) in the last column of the fourth row of the table (which describes the Social Policy committee), 
omit “5 Member committee” and substitute “4 Member committee”; and  

(3) in the last column of the sixth row of the table (which describes the membership of the Public 
Accounts and Administration committee):  

(a) omit “3 Member committee” and substitute “4 Member committee”; and  

(b) insert “1 Greens Member”. 


